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A rare opportunity to purchase an un-modernised, three
bedroom, detached bungalow in this much sought after
close. The property has the considerable advantage of
being situated on the south side of the close therefore
having a large, enclosed south facing garden. East
Wittering village centre is within 400m while the beach is
just 300m away.

The property is offered with the benefit of vacant
possession and no onward chain.

Virtual viewing link: https://my.matterport.com/show/?
m=D6qMpJzFCpy

Entrance Hall: (W) Two double built in cupboards. Radiator.
Access to loft area.

Kitchen: (W) Range of white fronted units with 1 and 1/2
inset porcelain sink unit, plumbing for washing machine
and dishwasher. Space for cooker with hood over.

Full width Sun Room: (S, E and W) Part brick built with Pine
panelled ceiling and engineered oak flooring. Radiator.
Door to the rear garden.

Living Room: (S and E) Fire place with tiled surround and
hearth. Serving hatch to kitchen. Radiator.

Bedroom One: (N) Radiator. Unit with mirror fronted double
wardrobe cupboard, further wardrobes and drawers.

Bedroom Two: (N) Radiator. 

Bedroom Three: (E) radiator. 

Shower Room (formerly a bathroom) Wash basin with
cupboard below, shower cubicle with sliding shower
screen door.

Separate W.C. 

Outside:

Garage: Attached brick built Garage with electric roller
shutter door and personal door at the rear leading to the
garden. 

The rear garden is a particular feature of the property facing
south and enclosed with block and ship lap fencing to all
boundaries and laid to lawn with shrub border. There are
two timber sheds. Paved terrace area.

The front garden has a low brick wall to the boundary and is
laid to lawn with a brick qouins driveway leading to the
garage and further paved area for additional parking.

Viewing by appointment with the office please, 01243
672217.
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